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I’m going to demonstrate how when I’m looking at material, I begin to think in terms of 
which “frame” will get the children closer to the event. Now in the beginning, when you 
look at “frame,” people think I’m taking children away from the event, like – “How would 
you get them anywhere near the Good Samaritan [story], if you were dealing with 
[running] a hospice situation?” … Of course, you would get very close to the Good 
Samaritan. You are actually wanting people to consider the nature of taking enormous 
risks, getting rid of prejudice, and helping a seeming enemy – and possibly being deeply 
endangered because of it. That’s what the Good Samaritan might be about.  

 

So it doesn’t matter which frame you chose, it’s chosen to get nearer to it. not further 
away. The one [frame where] they’ll be furthest away on, is frame number one 
[participant in the event], where the children act the story. They will never get into it that 
way, not in a hundred years, not efficiently. But they could be into it just like that [snaps 
her fingers], if they were running a hospice, and choosing the logo…  

 

Now, all of my life, I’ve been accused of taking children away from the real “now” events 
of the world, because people don’t hear the internal coherence of the journey one makes 
with it. … 

 

According to how a person sees an event, and how they feel part of an event, so they 
understand and think about the event. So, if an event has occurred to you, and I say, 
“How did you get on at the doctors?”, that event has already happened to you. You are 
not going to act it out now, you are not at the doctors, but somebody has said, “How did 
you get on at the doctors?” So you now reconstruct the event and explain it to me. So, at 
that point, you are working in the frame distance of “guide.” … “I was there. I saw it. I can 
tell you of it.” … So all your thinking about the event frees you from having to 
demonstrate what you did when you were there. You don’t have to show me what you 



did when you were there, and feel it all again. What you can do is understand it 
differently because I’ve asked you about it. 

 

So, if children say, “Can we have a battle?”, and you know what they think of as a battle is 
standing up and pretending to hit one another, you know you're not going to get very 
near the truth, because you know, (a) you're not supposed to let them really hit one 
another, because that would be silly. For them to be able to conduct a battle, whether it's 
with bows and arrows, or tomahawks, or modern British armoury, it's virtually impossible 
to do that and feel it at the same time, without ages and ages of deep consideration. 

 

But to set it up so that one says, “And how was it?” Then a person knows: they have a 
spectator [i.e., you as teacher in role, asking the question], and the spectator in 
themselves [i.e. in their own head] is re-membering it. Not just remembering it and 
recalling it, but putting it together again. So their understanding and learning about the 
battle is of a different kind, a different nature, and a different degree of getting close to it. 

 

So if I say - and I'm benign in my saying it – “How was it at Scutari? Teach me how it was.” 
The language … is: “And there we lay.” “Show me how it was.” “We lay so.” … “And show 
me this woman - how she came round with her lamp. How was it?” 

 

In the telling and the nature of my questions, children can get much, much closer to a 
consideration of how it was. Does that make a bit of sense to you? My questions are all 
benign. That is, I am not challenging them yet, to – “Go on, show me!” I am saying, “Teach 
me who was not there, how it must have been for you.” … Then you get this amazing 
feeling. 

 

 
 
  



  
 
The Good Samaritan to me is a horrendous tale. It is so evil. To get the full horror of what it 
must have been like - and bearing in mind that the whole place was under the heel of Rome. 
Roman soldiers were everywhere, supposedly keeping order around here, and these sorts 
of things could go on. And who would they sympathise with? And how would people see 
the Romans?  
 
So I chose as my “guides,” shepherds who saw it [the assault], and realised that their hut 
had been used by the thieves. And they have seen it and know they have been seen seeing 
it. And that is really scary. ... They have found their hut has been invaded, they inadvertently 
see a man beaten and so on, and robbed, and know they have been recognised. “And men 
who would do that to him, and will use our few puny supplies, and possibly kill one of our 
sheep, will come back.” So when their [the shepherds’] wives come and say, “Why are you 
not home?”, they can tell of it. They saw. And they saw the priest and they saw a Levite, 
and they saw a Samaritan do this thing. But they know they were seen, and their lives won't 
be the same.  
 
Now do you see why you get closer to the horror of it? But of course, I had to invent a 
scenario. I had to invent people who could be the “guide”. ... Only people from afar 
[watching on the hill] could see all of it, and know that he was taken to an inn. Because 
from high up here, you can see it. But if you see it knowing you were seen, it's quite 
different, in terms of the tension.  
 
  



  
 
Now if we take the second one. ... The second one is, “I have to re-enact it.” Not: “I choose 
to help you.” But: “I have to. Because I am the agent who will make people understand.” 
Now if you heard the terrible thing in the news the other day, when the woman in Baghdad 
screamed at the British reporter, “We are people! We are human,” she said. She was in the 
event. The reporter was the guide to the event. But because he had a tape recorder, he 
could say, “This morning this woman said this to me.” And then he could play her, because 
of modern technology. And children can do that. And they'll do it because it's from a tape 
recording, they're doing it – they’ve prepared a tape recording of it.  
 
Now when you come to the agent, it is an authority-figure that demands to know. Now you 
see, if I go back to my Minamata [example],* the Chisso [factory] manager might at this 
point be the agent. “Prove to me that what has happened to these families is to do with the 
effluent from my factory. If you want anything done about it, you'll have to be the agent of 
expression of it.”  
 
So you don't necessarily have to be so helpful. And they will show you, because you breed 
the will in them. ... Now sometimes of course, it might be done because it hasn't been clear 
so far as to what is happening in this situation, so an agent might come forward because 
he's trusted to explain it. The policeman is such an agent in court, when he offers evidence. 
He may - he would have been there, but he isn't the guide, because the court makes him be 
the agent. ...  
 
They run in a bit close [guide and agent], but they are quite different in the way you have 
to think. So you see, the policeman who has to describe - he may have to describe a murder. 
As an agent he can demonstrate it in all kinds of ways. He can use a blackboard. He can 
draw some blood stains. And it is demanded of him that he does it…  
 
* Drama about the Minamata disaster in Japan. See Teaching Political Awareness Through 
Drama (University of Newcastle 1982). 
 
  



 
 

“I am the authority.” Now here, the authority can make you repeat it and repeat it and 

repeat it and repeat it. So the authority figure has the power to penalise, if necessary. And 

the authority is not saying, “You reconstruct the event for me.” The authority is saying, 

“We must reconstruct this event.” 

Now, an example of that might be: after the Brighton bombing … the authority figure may 

be saying, “We have to reconstruct exactly who was in which room, where all the servants 

were, who knew who was in which room, where the registers were kept, because we have 

to somehow find out who got in, when they got in, and how they got the bomb in. 

Because until we find this out, we can't start looking.” ...  

Your authority figure will reconstruct it, because they have to, before they can start to 

deal with the situation in any way. So they call in witnesses from all over, and so on - 

which gives you enormous scope, and you'll get terribly close to the event, you see. I 

mean the terror of - if you had to act out the Brighton bombing, it's hopeless, because you 

can't fall down 7 floors and carry - it's very difficult to demonstrate it. But at the authority 

figure level, you can say, “Can you just walk down 28 steps, and we’ll time it and see 

where he might have slipped in while you were doing that.” It's terribly tense. It gets very, 

very exciting. Much more exciting than re-enacting the event. Because the spectator [in 

the head] knows, “I'm going down 28 steps. I know I did that, and I know out the corner of 

my eye, there was somebody in a white coat, and I thought that they were a porter, but 

now I realise they may not have been. They may have been actually watching the room I 

went in.” I mean my hair’s standing on end now, is yours? Just at the very thought of it. 

Because the spectator is awake, in a very special way.  



 
 
Now the next one is the recorder. Now the recorder is not reconstructing the event, in order 
to do something else. The recorder is able to go back and say, “Would you state again? Are 
you certain? Because what we write now will be read maybe in 100 years, so we must 
interpret it very, very carefully, and record it thus and thus.” So that allows you to go closer 
and closer, and go back over it, and have it again, and again, and again. I have an example 
of that with some Canadian children. ...  
 
These Canadian children had designed an air crash, and they'd done it entirely on flying over 
a forest in a helicopter, and drawing all the broken trees, so that they could actually see 
where the 707 Air Canada landed. So you got a bit of a tail plane here, seats over there, that 
tree snapped off, all the terrible raw wounds in the forest. Nobody could get out to there, 
because they’d chosen a very remote area of Northern Canada, just on the borders of 
Alaska, so we flew over to record how we think the order of the experience must have been. 
So you've got somebody saying, “Take me over the tail again. No, it must have come out 
after the door because there's a piece of tree there that some—.”  
 
And we were recording it for evidence. Later we would listen to the pilot’s black box, if we 
could find it, and our record of what we thought applied could then be checked against the 
black box, which we didn't have yet. Do you see what I mean?  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
The next one is the press. Now this is quite different, because when we look at that event, 
we are recreating the event through us, for the people we want to read it. So the press are 
doing a very creative thing, and they may not be necessarily dealing with it at all. I mean, if 
we were the press flying over that air crash I just mentioned, we would be creating a 
dialogue between ourselves and our audience [about] how to describe this for somebody 
who never saw it but buys the paper that puts in these sorts of morbid details. Or the press 
who says, “Air Canada isn't safe. This is the 4th crash this month. Something ought to be 
done.” But when we were flying over to record it, we didn't have that feeling. We were 
neither for, nor against. We were trying to identify - when a boy said, “There's a woman's 
handbag down there,” then we must check the passenger list later because that may tell us 
something about where she was sitting. It's benign. it doesn't have an opinion. It looks at 
evidence. Okay? 
 
You can see how children’s thinking, imagination and understanding is totally different. 
That's why it's such a wonderful tool, because according to what do you want them to 
perceive  about an event, and how they will discuss it, and explore it and involve themselves 
in it, creates totally [preparative?] knowledge.  
  



 
 
And then we come to the researcher. “I'm examining this, in order to see where this fits the 
pattern of all such things.” So you see, the researcher, if you take your Air Canada flight, 
they’re looking into the nervous responses of flight staff, and better training for them to 
deal with emergencies. Or the researcher may have 52 engines that have fallen apart, in 
different parts of the world, over the last 20 years; and he's seeking to put the pattern 
together. So the researcher’s eye, when he flies over in a helicopter to look at the results of 
this crash, has all these comparisons to do. He's seeing whether anything is repeated. He's 
seeing if there are any unique features. He's not identifying with the people.  
 
Now, if … a doctor flew over the air crash, he might be a guide, because the doctor might 
be saying, “There definitely does seem to be a pattern in the way bodies fall, because seats 
are facing the front. I examined all these people, all the bodies were brought in and I 
examined all the people who survived. So I'm your guide, but I might do it through the 
medical interest.” A priest might do it through the human interest, because he gave the last 
rites, and is now comforting or has comforted other people. So he can guide people as to 
the help these people will need when they finally come out of hospital. … You're a different 
audience each time.  
  



 
 
Now the critic has a point-of-view, of course. So what the critic does is interpret the event.  
 
Now when my children in Canada dealt with the air crash, at one stage they were 
functioning as critics. Don't think of the critic as the person who criticises. Frequently they 
sound like that but we're not discussing that. The critic interprets, so when my children in 
the Air Canada crash, which was their choice of material - they made envelopes.  I gave 
them big envelopes and said, “We know the passenger list [because we'd invented it 
ourselves], will you take any one of the passengers and in the envelopes tonight when you 
go home, put in the small shreds of bits and pieces we found, that belonged to them, after 
the crash, that can be finally returned to their family. And you don’t have to put real objects 
in, if you can’t find what you want. Put in a symbolic object; so you see, if you say, there 
was a very expensive bottle of perfume, and by a miracle it hadn't broken, they bought it 
duty free, and you simply draw an expensive bottle of perfume, then I'll know what that is. 
... [Teachers and students all made the envelopes] We produced our 75 brown envelopes … 
And then the children were asked to pick up any one that was not theirs.  
 
Now you see at this point, they’re functioning as critics. They sit themselves down, they 
open the envelopes, and they interpret what they think the person at that moment may 
have understood - I don't like the word “felt”; understood. I remember this boy, he found 
a kidney donor card in his envelope; a half-written letter, that said, “I'm not coming home 
as early as I'd expected because I have one or two appointments to keep.” There was also 
what they call a bubble clip, with a little bow and ribbon on it, in this envelope. … And half 
a picture - you know the praying hands? There was half of it burned off. Now you see, he, 
at this stage, is a critic, because when we come to look at this evidence, and how it must 
have been; and, “Can we use this as evidence as to how these people may have responded?” 
– you’re getting so near the air crash. This boy, you see, he’s saying, “Well, I think she was 
in deep trouble, because this kidney dialysis card is very new, and I think, you know, she's, 
she's obviously been making a flight to start this life on dialysis. And this letter to her 
mother, she can’t go home. That's terrible,” he said. I said, “I know.” “And those hands, well 
- maybe she was religious. Is there any evidence that she was religious?” … You can't 



imagine anything so moving as we're all sitting here as this “critic” interpreted this lady.  
And they were all doing the same, and they were not all pathetic. I mean three guys had 
discovered gold, and by, they were going to grab a lot. And, you know, because they were 
all sitting together, and they had rather foreign-sounding names, whoever built those three 
had built them up into a right team of scallywags.  
 
… So they weren't all pathetic but they were all terrible, because they died. Now that's an 
example of how the critic would function in the event. And there was never so close an air 
crash as that, as people sat there taking these things out, and building a life. Because then 
you see, you could say quite naturally, “I suppose from all this evidence, we could actually 
put the 70 people into the plane, and we could almost know, when the pilot said, ‘This is a 
white out’, something of what happened to them.” And they were able to do it. At that 
point, you see, they were not ‘I am in the event’, they were still the critic, interpreting how 
it must have been. … So they haven't gone to stage one, “I am in the event, it is happening 
to me”, because that is not what they were. They were never in the crash, ever. They were 
the ones who knew there’d been one.  
  



 
 
And then you come to the last one, of course, which is the artist, who says, “This event so 
interests and intrigues me, I will create another event from this.” So your artist is the one 
who interprets in action, either in the same mode, and says, “Okay, I'll do a movie of the 
crash. I’ll use it as the basis of a movie.” Or, “I'll paint it as a picture.” Or, “I’ll use it to do 
something about broken wings, and deal with Icarus” - because it doesn't matter where you 
go, it's because you’ve made a link with it. 
 
Now, that long explanation – I’m apologising for it, but at the same time, unless you pin it 
to action, it stays somewhere over there. You can't make it work. At least, I can't make it 
work. It doesn't get into: how does the thinking happen, because you are using this kind of 
language, and this kind of demonstration of the event? 
 
  























 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

This booklet has been compiled by Midland Actors Theatre as part of 

our Erasmus Plus project on Dorothy Heathcote’s Rolling Role system 

 

 

 

 

 

 


